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You’re More Ready Than You Think…To Own Your First Home 
 
In every challenge there is an opportunity 
 
For most of the last decade, The Connecticut Housing Finance Authority purchases about 4,000 
loans for first-time homebuyers. In 2009 CHFA saw their homebuyer loan program drop below 
2,000 loans.  This was a significant drop for a program, but even more disturbing was that 
CHFA’s market share dropped 25% that year.  So although overall home sales in Connecticut 
were slow due to the economic crisis, CHFA’s share of the market was shrinking. There was 
clearly something more than a weak market affecting the volume of CHFA’s first-time 
homebuyer loans. 
 
CHFA’s first time homebuyer program offered great benefits to renters who wanted to purchase 
their first home.  The program offered a low interest rate, a stable fixed 30-year mortgage and 
downpayment assistance loans that could include closing costs.  The borrower could be in their 
first home with almost no upfront investment. Income limits and sales price limits were generous 
and could apply to a large percentage of first time homebuyers in most parts of the state. So what 
was impacting market share? 
 
We knew that interest rates were a factor working against us. With historically low interest rates, 
CHFA’s traditional advantage of lower interest rates was minimized. But CHFA’s interest rates 
were still lower than most lenders. So why weren’t more people buying homes and utilizing our 
program? 
 
In 2009 the economy was in turmoil with the unemployment rate jumping from 5% at the 
beginning of 2008 to 7% in the beginning of 2009. Connecticut’s unemployment rate has 
hovered around 4% for decades, so we were sure that this rough patch would pass and the state 
economy would be back on track. It wouldn’t go any higher. In fact, since 1982, Connecticut’s 
unemployment rate had never been higher than 7.4%. Expectations were that unemployment 
would peak and home sales would bounce back once the crisis was over. We were wrong.  
 
Unemployment continued to increase, jumping to 9% and stubbornly staying there.  CHFA’s 
first time home buyer program and home sales in Connecticut were not going to bounce back.  
We were in trouble and needed a plan. 
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The plan 
 
CHFA still had a great product with lots of great benefits.  It was affordable. More importantly, 
for the first time in decades it was a great time to buy a home in Connecticut with normally high 
priced homes and interest rates at historic lows. We had to get the word out, not just for us, but 
for the economy of Connecticut which depended on a robust housing market to recover.  
 
CHFA conducted research among both lenders and realtors to understand the market from their 
point of view and to determine how CHFA could influence a customer’s decision.  Did we need 
to get the word out to lenders and realtors or did we need to inform actual homebuyers of our 
great product?  Informing homeowners was a larger and more expensive strategy and we 
reasoned that the lenders and realtors were really our sales force.  
 
We began an aggressive campaign to let as many realtors and lenders know about our great 
product. We sent e-mail alerts, made personal visits, joined and spoke at realtor and lender 
events, provided new brochures and talked to and called our partners as much as possible.   
 
It turned out that lenders and relators have so many other products and priorities that CHFA’s 
product was not always what they wanted to use for their homebuyers  – except when the 
homebuyer did not have funds for a down payment which made a CHFA down payment 
assistance loan a necessity. Our partners were not going to do all of the selling for us – we had to 
participate in the marketing process and generate greater awareness for CHFA.  
 
By the end of 2011, CHFA decided to take a leap into the deep end and began planning for its 
first ever advertising media campaign aimed at first time homebuyers. 
 
The campaign 
 
From all of the research that we had gathered over the past two years we knew a few things: 
 

1. The largest barrier to first time homeownership is saving for the down payment. 
2. Economic conditions and high unemployment have made people reluctant to commit to 

buying a home. 
3. Many people thought they weren’t ready to buy a home because they couldn’t afford the 

monthly payments. 
4. Renters were still very interested in owning their own home regardless of the financial 

concerns they had. 
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These four points would become the platform for a media campaign aimed at renters who wanted 
to own their first home. CHFA contracted with an ad agency that brainstormed, tested and 
discussed a variety of ideas.  From that information, they fully developed three themes for CHFA 
to consider.  The theme that finally chosen was “You’re More Ready Than You Think…To Buy 
Your First Home” 
 
Television and radio ads were developed around this theme as well as brochures and other 
material for lenders and realtors to have at their disposal. In the fall of 2012, CHFA began 
running television and radio ads which promoted the idea of owning your first home. 
 
Television commercials showed a cluttered apartment with a couple who have clearly run out of 
room. The husband is in the kitchen at the refrigerator drinking milk from the carton.  The wife’s 
back is turned away from the kitchen while she works on her laptop.  While she’s surfing the 
internet, she comes across CHFA’s website and begins telling her husband about the benefits of 
the product.  As she reads about low interest rates and down payment assistance, she gets more 
and more excited. In the background there is a low sound of clinking dishes which she is not 
paying attention to. She finally gets so excited because she realizes that, although they thought 
they would have to wait, they are actually ready to buy a home.  She turns around and her 
husband has packed up their kitchen because he realized that they were more ready than they 
thought to buy their first home. 
 

(See Links for TV and Radio Ads in attachment) 
 
This media campaign was reinforced through lenders and realtors who were provided with new 
brochures and other material. Outreach to these partners also continued at a high pace to further 
encourage lenders and realtors to utilize CHFA’s product.  (see attached Brochures)  
 
The results 
 
As soon as the ads started running, CHFA’s website received an almost 20% increase in activity.  
Once the ads ended, website activity returned to normal levels. In addition, the number of homes 
sold in Connecticut increased by 12% in 2012.  This was the first significant increase in home 
sales in Connecticut in five years.  
 
Through this campaign, CHFA found out that by advertising we can increase website activity 
and perhaps encourage people to buy a home.   



Web Graphics

CHFA TV:
https://vimeo.com/68776326

CHFA Radio:
https://vimeo.com/68781990

https://vimeo.com/68776326
https://vimeo.com/68781990


Tri-fold Brochure - English
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